

Temporary Staffing Pricing as of March 2017

	22nd Century Technologies	Advance Personnel Services	AppleOne	Century Security Event Staffing	Crescent Solutions	ManpowerGroup	Marathon Staffing	Millenium Staffing Solutions	My Next Career Path Staffing
Position /Description	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged
ACA Charge			AppleOne will bill-back to UNLV a monthly pass-through amount of \$197 for only those temporary and payroll workers who take the ACA compliant benefit plan					Affordable Care Act (ACA) surcharge: A 1.2% ACA surcharge will be added to each invoice total	
Professional Accountant:	\$24.30 - \$33.75	No Bid	\$26.46	No Bid	No Bid	\$30.58 - \$33.36	\$26.45	\$30.20	\$32.67
Accounts Payable/General Accounting/Payroll Assistant:	\$17.55 - \$20.25	No Bid	\$18.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$20.85	\$18.35	\$18.47	\$23.48
Bartender:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$10.73	\$10.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$16.68	\$15.10	\$13.78	\$14.63
Booksellers/Cashiers	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$12.56	No Bid	No Bid	25.02	\$13.24	\$13.00	\$14.95
Food Server:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.05	\$10.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$11.97	\$11.24	\$12.08
Cashier	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$11.05	\$12.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.39	\$11.98	\$14.95
Computer Technician:	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$19.84	No Bid	\$29.00 - \$34.00	\$22.00 - \$27.00	\$21.12	\$19.43	\$23.99
Concession Cashier:	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$11.05	\$12.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$11.97	\$11.98	\$12.83
Concession Runner:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	No Bid	\$13.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$11.97	\$11.37	\$13.82
Concession Service Prep (Stand Worker):	\$13.50 - \$20.25	No Bid	\$13.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$11.97	\$11.37	\$11.88
Concession Stand Leader:	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$12.03	\$13.23	No Bid	No Bid	16.68	\$13.50	\$12.38	\$13.10
Construction - Unskilled Labor	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$13.00	\$10.92 - \$13.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$13.80	\$12.40	\$15.37
Custodial Workers:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$13.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.55 - \$15.29	\$12.13	\$11.88	\$15.65
DataBase Administrator	\$54.00 - \$94.50	No Bid	\$28.62 - \$34.98	No Bid	\$62.00 - \$85.00	\$82.00 - \$87.00	\$28.00 - \$40.95	\$34.70	\$80.32
Data Entry Clerk:	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$13.00	\$13.23 - \$15.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$13.48	\$13.58	\$15.71
Dental Office - Front Desk	\$13.50 - \$20.25	No Bid	\$13.23 - \$15.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.07 - \$20.85	\$16.10	\$15.16	\$17.35
Dental Office - Back Office	\$16.20 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$17.20 - \$19.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.46 - \$22.24	\$18.92	\$18.74	\$18.90
Dentist	\$67.50 - \$108.00	No Bid	Permanent Only	No Bid	No Bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$66.23
Dishwasher:	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$11.05	\$11.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$11.25	\$11.24	\$14.45
Executive Assistant	\$20.25 - \$24.30	\$20.80	\$22.33 - \$31.75	No Bid	No Bid	\$25.02 - \$27.80	\$22.27	\$20.74	\$23.99
File Clerk:	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$13.00	\$13.23	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$12.49	\$12.71	\$15.91
General Labor:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$11.00 - \$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$12.49	\$11.88	\$13.65
Kitchen Worker:	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$11.38	\$11.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.55 - \$15.29	\$12.13	\$11.24	\$13.77
Landscapers and Grounds Maintenance	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$12.68	\$15.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$12.49	no bid	\$15.45
Line Cook:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$14.30	\$19.84	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$13.23	\$13.58	\$14.12
Loader:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$11.00 - \$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$12.64	\$11.88	\$13.77
Medical Office Assistant	\$16.20 - \$20.25	No Bid	\$13.25 - \$15.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.46 - \$22.24	\$13.75	\$13.58	\$19.15
Mover	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$14.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$13.75	\$11.88	\$13.54
Network Engineer	\$54.00 - \$81.00	No Bid	\$41.34 - \$64.00	No Bid	\$62.00 - \$85.00	\$69.00 - \$74.00	\$35.23	\$37.98	\$70.15
Parking Attendant:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.06	\$12.31	\$13.53
Parking Cashiers:	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$11.70	\$12.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.26	\$11.98	\$12.13
Pre/Post Clean Up:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$11.70	\$14.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.13	\$11.49	\$13.82
Receptionist:	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$13.00	\$13.25 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$13.65	\$13.58	\$15.62
Runners:	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$11.70	\$13.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$12.49	\$11.37	\$12.01
Secretary:	\$20.25 - \$24.30	\$15.88 - \$19.84	\$19.84 - \$24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.07 - \$19.46	\$16.80	\$16.42	\$18.85
Security Staff:	\$27.00 - \$33.75	No Bid	\$16.00 - \$20.00	\$17.00	No Bid	no bid	no bid	\$16.28	\$16.86
Special Usher:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$12.03	\$14.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$13.65	\$12.22	\$13.82
Stagehand Specialties (Carpenter):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$20.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.46 - \$22.24	\$22.15	\$22.41	\$24.06
Stagehand Specialties (Lighting Technician):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$20.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.07 - \$19.46	\$22.15	no bid	\$26.62
Stagehand Specialties (Audio Technician):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$20.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.46 - \$22.24	\$22.15	no bid	\$27.55
Stagehand Specialties (Video Technician):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$20.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.46 - \$22.24	\$22.15	no bid	\$27.45
Stagehand Specialties (Spot Light Operator):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$20.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.94 - \$15.99	\$23.95	no bid	\$28.23
Stagehand Specialties (Loader):	\$13.50 - \$16.20	No Bid	\$14.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$13.75	\$13.49	\$14.40
Stagehand Specialties (Wardrobe Assistant):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$18.00 - \$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$16.17	\$16.28	\$16.78
Stagehand Specialties (General Stagehand):	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$14.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$16.17	\$16.30	\$16.78
Systems Administrator	\$54.00 - \$94.50	No Bid	\$50.00 - \$60.00	No Bid	\$62.00 - \$85.00	\$55.00 - \$60.00	\$44.54	\$43.14	\$51.55
Ticket Taker:	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$12.03	\$13.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.38	\$11.88	\$13.77
Traffic Control:	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$12.35	\$14.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.38	\$12.49	\$13.77

	22nd Century Technologies	Advance Personnel Services	AppleOne	Century Security Event Staffing	Crescent Solutions	ManpowerGroup	Marathon Staffing	Millenium Staffing Solutions	My Next Career Path Staffing
Position /Description	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged	Hourly Rate Charged
Transcriber:	\$20.25 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$20.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$17.64	\$16.42	\$17.99
Usher:	\$13.50 - \$20.25	\$11.70	\$13.00 - \$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.16 - \$13.21	\$12.38	\$12.04	\$12.01
Word Processor:	\$20.25 - \$27.00	\$15.60	\$16.00 - \$20.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$15.88	\$16.06	\$16.65
**Office Assistant I:	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$13.50	\$18.00 - \$20.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$13.50	\$13.38	\$15.91
**Office Assistant II:	\$20.25 - \$27.00	\$14.78	\$20.00 - \$23.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.68 - \$18.07	\$14.75	\$14.72	\$17.99
**Office Specialist:	\$20.25 - \$33.75	\$14.78	\$24.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.07 - \$19.46	\$15.75	\$14.94	\$15.62
**Records Technician:	\$20.25 - \$27.00	\$13.50	\$16.00 - \$20.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.68 - \$18.07	\$13.75	\$13.58	\$17.30
Programmer Analyst:	\$54.00 - \$81.00	No Bid	\$28.00 - \$33.65	No Bid	\$47.00 - \$69.61	\$75.00 - \$80.00	\$44.00	\$42.97 - \$48.89	\$61.84
Sr. Programmer Analyst:	\$67.50 - \$94.50	No Bid	\$33.00 - \$39.90	No Bid	\$65.82 - \$98.65	\$83.00 - \$88.00	\$52.00	\$49.97 - \$55.92	\$68.40
Network Analyst:	\$67.50 - \$81.00	No Bid	\$23.00 - \$27.00	No Bid	\$64.45 - \$85.00	\$52.00 - \$57.00	\$37.45	\$41.70 - \$47.45	\$50.26
Temporary Pharmacist	\$67.50 - \$94.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$81.52 - \$83.53	no bid	no bid	no bid
Temporary Pharmacy Technician	\$40.50 - \$54.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.56 - \$23.39	no bid	no bid	no bid
**Office Aide	\$13.50 - \$16.20	\$13.00	\$13.50 - \$15.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.90 - \$15.29	\$12.95	\$12.71	no bid
**Office Clerk I	\$16.20 - \$20.25	\$14.30	\$13.50 - \$15.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.29 - \$16.68	\$13.50	\$13.95	no bid
**Office Clerk II	\$20.25 - \$24.30	\$15.60	\$14.50 - \$17.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.99 - \$17.38	\$14.75	\$14.72	no bid
**Secretary (For Clark County Government)	\$20.25 - \$24.30	No Bid	\$17.00 - \$25.98	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.07 - \$19.46	\$16.80	\$15.92	no bid
**Audio Visual Systems Technician	\$27.00 - \$54.00	No Bid	\$18.98 - \$25.98	No Bid	\$29.00 - \$45.53	\$25.02 - \$27.80	\$19.70	\$20.67	no bid
Other Positions Offered:				Security Supervisor: \$21.00	Project Manager: \$55.00 - \$100.00			Customer Service - provide customer service either in - person or over the phone: \$13.38 - \$14.42	
				Security Staff (holiday): \$23.25	Web Developer: \$50.00 - \$85.00			Contact Center Rep - call center rep that also responds via email or web-service: \$13.38	
				Security Supervisor (holiday): \$29.00	Software Engineers: \$50.00 - \$95.00			General Maintenance - skilled in commercial general maintenance and	
					Business Analyst: \$50.00 - \$80.00			Painter - Skilled commercial painter: \$21.88	
					Application Support: \$45.00 - \$65.00			Electrician - Skilled commercial electrician: \$23.59	
					Systems Engineers: \$48.00 - \$95.00			Flooring Specialist - skilled commercial flooring specialist: \$22.41	
								Human Resource Specialist: \$19.98	
Additional Charges	Background Checks: \$0.00	National Background Check-Covering criminal records, civil, and financial information: \$25.00	Background Check Fee: \$0.00	Criminal Background check for each state where employee has woked or resided: \$0.00	Criminal - Federal Nationwide 7 Years: \$0.00	Review of Department of Motor Vehicles Records: Some out of pocket access fees may apply	Background Checks: \$0.00	10-panel drug screen: \$0.00	Full Service Background Check: \$49.99
	Drug Testing: \$0.00	Drug testing for position less than thirty (30) working days: \$25.00	Drug Screening Fee: \$0.00	Drug Testing: \$0.00	Criminal - Felony & Misdemeanor 7 Year Scope: \$0.00	All other Background Checks: \$0.00	Drug Testing: \$0.00	5-step background screening: \$0.00	Skills Based testing using Kenexa Prove It: \$15.99
		Local Background Check through Clark County Records: \$0.00	Direct Hire Placements: 10% of employee's first-year salary		National Criminal Locator: \$0.00	Drug Screening: \$0.00	Testing of Candidates: \$0.00	Reference checks: \$0.00	10 Panel Drug Test: \$24.99
		Drug testing for positions exceeding thirty (30) working days: \$0.00	ACA-compliant benefit plan: \$197.00/month		SSN Trace - TransUnion: \$0.00	Assessments: \$0.00			
					NDOT 10 panel urine screening: \$0.00				
					Skills Assessment: \$0.00				