Bid # 5233-RD

Exhibit A
Sunbelt Rentals

SECTIONE

PRICING RESPONSE FORM

Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.

It is the intent of UNLV to award to multiple Contractors' and all rentals are on an as needed basis.
Rates provided below should include delivery, set-up, and pick-up. The list of items below is not
meant to be an all-inclusive list. Bidder is instructed to provide list of all equipment that Bidder can
offer. If Bidder is unable to provide a particular item listed, fill in the blank with N/A (not available).
Pricing provided below shall remain firm for the initial one-year Term of the Contract.

ITEMS DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY
Heavy Equipment

A. Back-Hoe $ 200.00 $ s50.00 $ 1,350.00
B. Bobcat $ 195.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,100.00
C. Boom,Articulated,30' $ 210.00 $ 550.00 $ 1,200.00
D. Boom,Articulated,45',Dsl, $ 225.00 $ 550.00 $ 1,200.00
E. Boom,Articulated,45',Electric $ 225.00 $ 550.00 $ 1,200.00
F. Boom, Telescoping,126',Ds| $ 750.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 6,500.00
G. Boom, Telescoping,135',Dsl $ 950.00 $ 3,200.00 $ 7,500.00
H. Boom, Telescoping,60',Gas $ 250.00 $ 850.00 $ 1,500.00
I. Bucket Skidsteer $ no bid $ nobid $ no bid
J. Forklift,100001b,54', Telescoping | $ 350.00 $ 1,250.00 $ 2,500.00
K. Forklift,3600-50001Ib $ 150.00 $ 350.00 $ 650.00
L. Forklift,6000Ib,36', Telescoping | $ 250.00 $ 750.00 $ 1,300.00
M. Front Loaders $ 450.00 $ 1,200.00 $ 3,200.00
N. Generator,240kw,300kva,Ds $ 750.00 $ 2,500.00 $ 4,800.00
0. Generator,3.6kw,Gas $ 75.00 $ 150.00 $ 350.00
P. Jack,Pallet,5500Ib,Hydraulic $ 45.00 $ 110.00 $ 250.00
Q. Personnel Lift $ 110.00 $ 325.00 $ 650.00
R. Scissorlift,15',32",Electric $ 105.00 $ 225.00 $ 350.00
S. Scissorlift,19-20',32" Electric $ 125.00 $ 250.00 $ 375.00
T. Skidsteer $ 195.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,100.00
U. Sod Cutter,18",7hp,Gas $ 55.00 $ 175.00 $ 250.00
V. Trencher,Walk,16hp,4"X24" $ 95.00 $ 250.00 $ 450.00
Vehicles

A. Electric Carts/Utility 2 seat $ 95.00 $ 235.00 $ 540.00
B. Electric Carts/4 seat $110.00 $ 350.00 $ 650.00
C. Gas Carts $ 110.00 $ 350.00 $ 650.00
D. Trucks $ $ $ -
1.10° $ $ $ _—
2.14' $ $ 1%

3.17 $ nobid 1§ _— $ nobid
4,24 $ $

5. 26 $ $ $

E. Flat Bed Trucks [ s $ $
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Bid # 5233-RD

Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.

ITEMS

DAILY

WEEKLY

MONTHLY

Tents (Event)
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Audio Visual Equipment
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A. Projectors

N

B. Screens

C. Speakers

D. Video Cameras

E. DVD Players

F. HD Televisions

System

G. Sony HXC-100 HDTV Camera
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H. CD Player
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Lighting

A. Light Towers

$ 85.00

250.00

$ 450.00

B. Rigging

$ no bid

no bid

$ nobid

C. Production

$ no bid

no bid

$ no bid

D. Cable

$ 35.00

95.00

$ 150.00

E. Spider Boxes

$ 45.00
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125.00

$ 250.00

Entertainment Equipment

NO BID

A. Stages

B. Platforms/Podiums

e

C. Pipe and Drape

pd

D. Carpeting

E. Backdrops

F. Trussing Equipment

G. Scaffolding

| A | B A | P

N
0| | | A w0

Portable Restrooms

NO BID P

A. Portables

B. Executive Restrocoms

C. Hand Washing Stations
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Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.

Bid # 5233-RD _—
ITEMS DAILY WEEKLY MONTHLY
Fencing NO BID
A. Chain Link $ $ $
B. Barricades $ $ $
C. Pedestrian Rails/Bike Racks $ $ $
D. Barbed Wire
Hand Held 2-way Radios $NOBID $ $
Office Equipment NO BID
A. Fax Machines $ $ $
B. Photo Copiers $ $ $
C. Printers $ $ $
Furniture Rentals NO BID
A. Sofa $ $ $
B. Lamps $ $ $
C. Chairs $ $ $
D. Loveseat $ $ $
E. Coffee Tables $ $ $
F. End Tables $ $ $
Traffic Equipment NO BID
A. Message Boards $ $ $
B. 42" Traffic Cones $ $ $
C. 18" Traffic Cones $ $ $
D. Traffic Barrels $ $ $
E. Type |l Traffic Barricades/A— | $ $ $
frames
F. No Parking signs with A- $ $ $
frames
Party Equipment NO BID
A. Tube Sky Dancers $ $ $
B. Popcorn Machines w/ Scoop $ $ 5
C. Cotton Candy Machines w/ $ |$ $
Holder |
D. Sno-Kone w/ Tray and Holders | $ $ $
Parking Lot Sweeper $ 300.00 $ 450.00 $ 1,850.00
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Bid # 5233-RD Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.
Additional Fees per Rental

Bidders shall provide any additional fees below. UNLV will not be responsible for payment of any fees
that are not specifically provided in this Pricing Response Form.

Insurance $ Rental Protection plan available
Environmental Recovery Fees $ varies by equipment class {min. $1-$3.60)
Refueling Fees 9 varies by equipment and fuel type

Catalog Pricing

Completing the Pricing Response Form is mandatory, but as an option, Contractors may provide a
complete catalog and price list of all equipment available. Net price for equipment will be calculated
on published rental cost less specified percentage of discount applied to the price. If specific
categories of equipment can be grouped together for a discount, please identify types of equipment
included in the category, i.e., forklift, backhoe, bobcat, scissors lift. This price list is to be submitted
separately from the cne above.

Category % off list price

n/a n/a
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