Opening Date: Wednesday, September 24, 2014
BID # 5176-MH Inductively Coupled Plasma - Mass Spect

rometer (ICP-MS)

BUYER: Michelle Hayes

Bidder #1 Bidder #2 Bidder #3 Bidder #4
VWR International - NO BID Fisher Scientific Co., LLC Agilent Technologies, Inc. PerkinElmer Health Sciences, Inc.
Item # Description Brand Description Unit Price Brand Description Unit Price Brand Description Unit Price Brand Description Unit Price Brand Description Unit Price
Manufacturer
Inductively Coupled Plasma Mass Spectrometer (ICP-MS; . ThermofFisher Scientific Agilent Agilent PerkinElmer
L oup= L SRS { ! No Bid " 119,445.30 8 154,402.71 8 144,592.70 164,576.10
In accordance with Section D specifications iCAP Q ICP-MS ICPMS 7900 System 7700x ICP-MS NexION 300X ICP-MS
A random access auto sampler system . .
2 =R ITETY No Bid Cetac Technologies 6,703.00 6,825.70 6,825.70 Included
In accordance with Section D specifications, #11a
Water chiller for ICP-MS . . S
3 - ) - No Bid ThermoFisher Scientific 5,350.00 1,172.50 1,172.50 Included
In accordance with Section D specifications, #11b
On-Site Training Session
4 ) o S ) ) . ThermoFisher Scientific Included Included Included Included
Provide training session in accordance with Section D specifications, #12
Product Warranty
Price for the instrument shall include one year product warranty in Unity Lab Services, a
5 [3ccordance with Section D specifications, #13. ) Division of ThermoFisher|  Included Included Included Included
*Provide specific warranty information; if necessary, include i "
detailed description on a separate sheet and submit with your bid Scientific
resgonse.
Sub Total; N/B Sub Total] $131,498.30) Sub Total; $162,400.91] Sub Total; $152,590.90] Sub Total; $164,576.10]
1g, Handling, & Set-Up] Shipping, Handling, & Set Included Shipping, Handling, & Included Shipping, Handling, & Included Shipping, Handling, & Included
Total: N/B Total; 131,498.3g Total: 162,400.91] Total: 152,590.90] Total: 164,576.10]
Qry Description Additional Info Cost Additional Info Cost Additional Info Cost Additional Info Cost Additional Info Cost
Extended Warranty — Optional
*The first year of warranty
After the first year, provide pricing and details of any extended Warranty description in Per Agilent quotation Per Agilent quotation is included, the quoted is
1 N 7,000.00 11,814.60 11,814.60 " 15,108.00
warranties or maintenance and support offered. If necessary, include Section F 1712361 1712358 valid for another second
information on separate sheet and submit with your bid response. year*
*Any product description or services can be described on a separate Sub Total N/B Sub Total] $138,498.30f Sub Total $174,215.5] Sub Total $164,405.50] Sub Total $179,684.10]
document included with bid, but a separate document is not required for 1g, Handling, & Set-Up] Shipping, Handling, & Set Included Shipping, Handling, & Included Shipping, Handling, & Included Shipping, Handling, & Included
award to be determined. Grand Total: N/B Grand Total: 138,498.30] Grand Total| 174,215.51] Grand Total| 164,405.50) Grand Total| 179,684.10)




